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Town of Plymouth , Bid # 21526

Water Parts  12:00 Noon

DESCRIPTION QTY Ti Sales

I BRASS Total Total Total Total

1 3/4" Stop & Waste Curb Stop-Mueller H-15219 15 54.95 $824.25 $55.62 $834.30 $55.50 $832.50 No Bid No Bid

2 1" Ball Corp - Mueller B-25008 30 $48.90 $1,467.00 $49.37 $1,481.10 $49.20 $1,476.00 No Bid No Bid

3 1" Ball Corp Stop- Mueller B-25209, Full Port Opening 30 $78.80 $2,364.00 $79.87 $2,396.10 $79.63 $2,388.90 No Bid No Bid

4 1 1/2" Ball Corp  - Mueller B-25008 2 $109.90 $219.80 $111.38 $222.76 $111.03 $222.06 No Bid No Bid

5 1 1/2" Ball Curb Stop - Mueller B-25209 2 $179.40 $358.80 $181.80 $363.60 $181.23 $362.46 No Bid No Bid

6 2" Ball Corp- Mueller B-25008 2 $181.75 $363.50 $184.20 $368.40 $183.63 $367.26 No Bid No Bid

7 2" Ball Curb Stop - Mueller B-25209 2 $267.25 $534.50 $270.52 $541.04 $269.69 $539.38 No Bid No Bid

8 3/4" Three Part Union-Mueller H - 15403 40 $14.30 $572.00 $14.50 $580.00 $14.68 $587.20 No Bid No Bid

9 1" x 3/4" Three part Union Mueller h- 15403 40 $34.45 $1,378.00 $15.99 $639.60 $16.19 $647.60 No Bid No Bid

10 1" Three Part Union-Mueller H- 15403 60 $19.86 $1,191.60 $15.82 $949.20 $16.02 $961.20 No Bid No Bid

11 1 1/2" Adapter MIP Compression-Mueller H 15428 20 $39.50 $790.00 $38.82 $776.40 $39.31 $786.20 No Bid No Bid

12 2" Adapter MIP Compression-Mueller H 15428 10 $59.05 $590.50 $56.57 $565.70 $57.27 $572.70 No Bid No Bid

Total $10,653.95 $9,718.20 $9,743.46 $0.00

Note: All brass will be manufactured by Mueller, no 

substitutions.

II SERVICE AND GATE BOXES Total Total Total Total

1 Curb Box - Buffalo Style 5' N American Manuf Only* 50 $56.46 $2,823.00 $51.23 $2,561.50 $51.59 $2,579.50 60.62 $3,031.00

2 Curb Box Repair Cover - Inside 10 $19.20 $192.00 $9.67 $96.70 $22.91 $229.10 6.67 $66.70

3 Curb Box Repair Cover - Outside 10 $19.20 $192.00 $9.67 $96.70 $22.91 $229.10 6.67 $66.70

4 Service Box Extension 12" 10 $15.55 $155.50 $14.52 $145.20 $17.79 $177.90 18.67 $186.70

5 Curb Box Foot Piece 5 $9.50 $47.50 $15.28 $76.40 $16.64 $83.20 23.08 $115.40

6 Gate Box 3 piece, 5' 30 $112.45 $3,373.50 $99.14 $2,974.20 $92.30 $2,769.00 120.8 $3,624.00

7 Gate Box Riser with Cover-Pioneer Style 20 $18.00 $360.00 $34.86 $697.20 $49.20 $984.00 31.67 $633.40

8 Gate Box Riser with Cover - 1" 5 $31.46 $157.30 $30.93 $154.65 $32.33 $161.65 11.59 $57.95

9 Gate Box Riser with Cover - 1 1/2" 5 $33.36 $166.80 $32.91 $164.55 $34.43 $172.15 26.58 $132.90

10 Gate Box Riser with Cover - 2" N American Manuf Only 5 $34.34 $171.70 $33.90 $169.50 $35.49 $177.45 15.76 $78.80

Total $7,639.30 $7,136.60 $7,563.05 $7,993.55

 NOTE:All service Gate and Boxes will be North 

American Manufactured only

III SERVICE SADDLES Total Total Total Total

1 Tapping Saddle - 8" x 1", Smith-Blair #331 20 No Bid No Bid $45.37 $907.40 $46.68 $933.60 No Bid No Bid

2 Tapping Saddle - 8" x 1 1/2" Smith-Blair #331 4 No Bid No Bid $58.47 $233.88 $60.36 $241.44 No Bid No Bid

3 Tapping Saddle - 8" x 2"  Smith-Blair #313 2 No Bid No Bid $27.33 $54.66 $28.22 $56.44 No Bid No Bid

4 Tapping Saddle - 10" x 1" Smith-Blair #331 5 No Bid No Bid $56.48 $282.40 $58.30 $291.50 No Bid No Bid

5 Tapping Saddle - 10" x 1 1/2" Smith-Blair #331 2 No Bid No Bid $61.54 $123.08 $63.53 $127.06 No Bid No Bid

6 Tapping Saddle - 10" x 2" Smith-Blair #313 2 No Bid No Bid $36.05 $72.10 $37.21 $74.42 No Bid No Bid

7 Tapping Saddle - 12" x 1" Smith-Blair #331 2 No Bid No Bid $81.40 $162.80 $84.04 $168.08 No Bid No Bid
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8 Tapping Saddle - 12" x 1 1/2" Smith-Blair #331 2 No Bid No Bid $88.46 $176.92 $91.33 $182.66 No Bid No Bid

9 Tapping Saddle - 12" x 2" Smith-Blair #313 2 No Bid No Bid $43.21 $86.42 $44.61 $89.22 No Bid No Bid

10 Tapping Saddle - 16" x 1 1/2" Smith-Blair #331 1 No Bid No Bid $49.63 $49.63 $80.95 $80.95 No Bid No Bid

11 Tapping Saddle - 16" x 2" Smith-Blair #313 1 No Bid No Bid $78.41 $78.41 $80.95 $80.95 No Bid No Bid

Total $0.00 $2,227.70 $2,326.32 $0.00

NOTE: All saddles will be repaired type with CC 

THREAD AND FIT a.c. Pipe and Ductile Iron 

Pipe,Smith-Blair 331 or 313

IV HYDRANTS Total Total Total Total

1 Hydrant - 4 1/2' 1 No Bid $1,626.36 $1,626.36 $1,613.02 $1,613.02 No Bid

2 Hydrant - 5' 5 No Bid $1,663.28 $8,316.40 $1,649.64 $8,248.20 No Bid

3 Hydrant - 5 1/2 ' 10 No Bid $1,700.17 $17,001.70 $1,686.22 $16,862.20 No Bid

4 Hydrant - 6' 10 No Bid $1,737.00 $17,370.00 $1,722.75 $17,227.50 No Bid

5 Hydrant - 6 1/2' 5 No Bid $1,773.98 $8,869.90 $1,759.42 $8,797.10 No Bid

6 Hydrant - 7' 1 No Bid $1,810.81 $1,810.81 $1,795.95 $1,795.95 No Bid

Total $0.00 $54,995.17 $54,543.97 $0.00

All hydrants will be manufactured and registered as 

Mueller Centurion,250 (A-423) or American Darling 

(B-62-B-5), Open Right, painted yellow less 

accessories

V HYDRANT PARTS Total Total Total Total

1 Hydrant Valve Seat (rubber) 10 $47.20 $472.00 $107.84 $1,078.40 $122.38 $1,223.80 No Bid

2 Hydrant Extension - 6" 2 $255.20 $510.40 $313.29 $626.58 $353.91 $707.82 No Bid

3 Hydrnat Extension - 12" 2 $301.60 $603.20 $368.38 $736.76 $416.43 $832.86 No Bid

4 Hydrant Extension - 18" 2 $342.20 $684.40 $417.07 $834.14 $471.59 $943.18 No Bid

5 Hydrant Break Flange Repair Kit 5 $101.50 $507.50 $137.37 $686.85 $140.59 $702.95 No Bid

Total $2,777.50 $3,962.73 $4,410.61 $0.00

Note:All hydrant parts,extension kits and break kits 

are to be compatible with Mueller hydrants.

VI MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT Total Total Total Total

1 Retainer Gland - 6" 30 $31.12 $933.60 $29.31 $879.30 $40.52 $1,215.60 34.55 $1,036.50

2 Retainer Gland - 8" 30 $42.23 $1,266.90 $37.89 $1,136.70 $56.60 $1,698.00 47.74 $1,432.20

3 Retainer Gland - 10" 10 $60.34 $603.40 $53.65 $536.50 $78.48 $784.80 68.6 $686.00

4 Retainer Gland - 12" 10 $80.88 $808.80 $75.47 $754.70 $101.20 $1,012.00 93.71 $937.10

Total $3,612.70 $3,307.20 $4,710.40 $4,091.80

Note: All retainer glands are of North American 

manufacture only.All retainer glands must include 

bolts and gaskets

VII STAINLESS STEEL REPAIR CLAMPS Total Total Total Total

1 Stainless Steel Clamp - 4" x 15" 2 No Bid $106.95 $213.90 $109.39 $218.78 157.95 $315.90
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2 Stainless Steel Clamp - 6" x 12" 2 No Bid $93.58 $187.16 $95.71 $191.42 146.22 $292.44

3 Stainless Steel Clamp - 6" x 15" 2 No Bid $121.22 $242.44 $123.99 $247.98 183.02 $366.04

4 Stainless Steel Clamp - 8" x 15" 6 No Bid $137.84 $827.04 $140.99 $845.94 208.93 $1,253.58

5 Stainless Steel Clamp - 8" x 20" 6 No Bid $184.17 $1,105.02 $188.37 $1,130.22 286.13 $1,716.78

6 Stainless Steel Clamp - 10" x 15" 6 No Bid $178.98 $1,073.88 $183.06 $1,098.36 239.77 $1,438.62

7 Stainless Steel Clamp - 10" x 20" 6 No Bid $237.62 $1,425.72 $243.05 $1,458.30 320.85 $1,925.10

8 Stainless Steel Clamp - 12" x 15" 2 No Bid $196.05 $392.10 $200.53 $401.06 262.07 $524.14

9 Stainless Steel Clamp- 12" x 20" 2 No Bid $262.14 $524.28 $268.12 $536.24 358.27 $716.54

10 Stainless Steel Clamp - 6" x 12 1/2" 1 No Bid $111.88 $111.88 $114.43 $114.43 178.37 $178.37

11 Stainless Steel - 8" x 12 1/2 x 1" 1 No Bid $122.38 $122.38 $125.07 $125.07 195.28 $195.28

12 Stainless Steel - 12" x 12 1/2" x 1" 1 No Bid $182.43 $182.43 $125.07 $125.07 237.33 $237.33

Total $0.00 $6,408.23 $6,492.87 9,160.12$    

Notes: All repair clamps will be Smith-Blair, or Ford 

F-2

VIII METERS Total Total Total Total

1 Neptune T-10 5/8" x 5/8" 400 No Bid No Bid No Bid 207.84 $83,136.00

2 Neptune T-10  1" 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid 344.99 $6,899.80

3 Neptune T-10 1 1/2" - bronze flange 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 655.29 $6,552.90

4 Neptune T-10 2" - bronze flange 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 797.92 $7,979.20

5 Neptune 2" w/bronze flanges 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2043.03 $4,086.06

6 Neptune TRU/FLO 3"bronze flanges 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2996.8 $5,993.60

7 Neptune strainer 2" flanges 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid 278.32 $2,783.20

8 E-Coder/R900i T-10 Pit Register 45 No Bid No Bid No Bid 124.62 $5,607.90

9 R 900 V-3 Radio Unit 200 No Bid No Bid No Bid 103.85 $20,770.00

Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $143,808.66

Note: All meters register cubic feet.

IX METER PITS AND ADAPTERS Total Total Total Total

1 Meter Pit Complete - 20" x 5' 5/8" meter 5 No Bid $516.80 $2,584.00 No Bid 631.19 $3,155.95

2 Meter Pit Complete- 20" x 5' for 1" meter 5 No Bid $660.23 $3,301.15 No Bid 817.27 $4,086.35

3 Meter Tail Pieces 100 No Bid $7.83 $783.00 No Bid 9.37 $937.00

4 Meter Adapter - 5/8" to 3/4" 60 No Bid $11.90 $714.00 No Bid 14.23 $853.80

5 Meter Adapter - 5/8" to 1" 90 No Bid $14.88 $1,339.20 No Bid 17.80 $1,602.00

6 Meter wire 3 wire, 1000' reels or buckets 12 No Bid $145.00 $1,740.00 No Bid 90.00 $1,080.00

Total $0.00 $10,461.35 $0.00 $11,715.10

NOTE: All meter adapters will be purchased in full 

package quantities.

*Mechanical Joint Restraint has math error S/B 

$3307.20 Ferguson Listed as 3320.70


