Town of Plymouth

Regional Road Sand Bid Results

Bid 21540
10/2/2015
Company and Bid (dollars & cents per ton)
Cape Cod Plympton
G. Lopes Kingstown | Aggregates P.A. Sand & M&M Sand
Town Quantity | Construction Corp Corp Landers Gravel and Trucking

Barnstable 2000 $15.56 $17.08 $12.15 $17.42 No Bid No Bid
Brewster 2000 $16.90 $18.89 $13.25 $17.42 No Bid $9.00
Carver 2670 $10.20 $17.08 $10.45 $15.78 $11.74 No Bid
Chatham 500 $16.80 $20.71 $15.25 $19.06 No Bid $11.00
Cohasset 1500 $14.22 $17.98 $16.70 $15.78 No Bid No Bid
Eastham 200 $16.80 $20.71 $15.25 $19.06 No Bid $12.00
Halifax 500 $12.42 $17.08 $16.70 $15.78 No Bid No Bid
Hull 2500 $15.58 $17.98 $20.00 $17.42 No Bid No Bid
Kingston 100 $11.13 $17.08 $13.25 $15.78 No Bid No Bid
Lakeville 2200 $11.24 $17.98 $13.25 $17.42 No Bid No Bid
Marion 2000 $11.49 $17.08 $13.25 $17.42 No Bid No Bid
Mashpee 2000 $14.63 $17.08 $13.50 $15.78 No Bid No Bid
Mattapoisett 1200 $11.49 $17.08 $13.25 $17.42 No Bid No Bid
Nantucket - Del. 100 No Bid $49.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Picked Up 100 $7.80 $14.00 No Bid $9.50 No Bid No Bid

FOB Carver MA

Pembroke 7500 $11.94 $17.08 $12.25 $15.78 No Bid No Bid
*Plympton 1500 $12.98 $17.08 $16.25 $15.78 $11.89 No Bid
Sandwich 4000 $11.74 $17.08 $11.30 $13.05 No Bid No Bid
Whitman 1500 $14.22 $17.98 $15.00 $17.42 No Bid No Bid
Yarmouth 200 $16.28 $17.98 $13.75 $19.06 No Bid $11.20




