Town of Plymouth - Regional Salt Bid Results

Bid # 21621 | October 6, 2016
Road Salt
G.B. Sons Safe
All State American Eastern Constructio yhnovative Mid- P.A. Road Saltine

Est. Asphalt, Rock Salt Minerals n Company, surface American *Morton Landers, Services, Warrior,
Towns Amt. Inc. Co., LLC Inc. Inc. Solutions Salt, LLC Salt, Inc. Inc. LLC Inc.
Abington 2000/ No Bid $54.86 $50.50 No Bid No Bid $55.15 $72.56 $131.00 |No Bid $69.61
Barnstable 8000 No Bid $58.93 $56.00 No Bid No Bid $56.65 $77.11 $132.25 |No Bid $72.38
Bourne 3000-4000] No Bid $55.92 $54.25 No Bid No Bid $54.29 $74.54 $132.25 |No Bid $71.33
Brewster 500 No Bid $61.21 $58.35 No Bid No Bid $63.41 $78.79 $132.25 |No Bid $73.59
Bridgewater 3000 No Bid $54.78 $50.80 No Bid No Bid $53.37 $72.09 $131.00 |No Bid $70.34
Carver 500 No Bid $54.78 $52.30 No Bid No Bid $55.13 $72.09 $131.00 |No Bid $71.43
Chatham 1000 No Bid $62.00 $59.20 No Bid No Bid $67.32 $77.42 $131.00 |No Bid $74.08
Cohasset 1000 No Bid $57.64 $51.25 No Bid No Bid $56.12 $71.56 $130.00 |No Bid $70.25
Dennis 2000 No Bid $59.99 $57.00 No Bid No Bid $58.22 $77.11 $132.00 |No Bid $73.11
Eastham 500 No Bid $62.12 $59.64 No Bid No Bid $67.87 $77.42 $132.00 |No Bid $67.48
Easton 3000 No Bid $54.78 $50.75 No Bid No Bid $52.79 $70.90 $131.00 |No Bid $70.15
Edgartown (Deliver 600 No Bid $199.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.12 $227.11 $158.00 |No Bid No Bid
Picked up No Bid 60.00 $63.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $200.00 $126.00 |No Bid No Bid
Falmouth 4000 No Bid $58.30 $56.40 No Bid No Bid $56.27 $74.85 $131.00 |No Bid $72.62
Halifax 2750 No Bid $54.78 $51.20 No Bid No Bid $53.67 $72.09 $130.00 |No Bid $71.16
Harwich 2000 No Bid $60.71 $58.10 No Bid No Bid $67.54 $78.79 $131.00 |No Bid $73.19
Hull 2000 No Bid $57.97 $51.50 No Bid No Bid $57.45 $71.56 $130.00 |No Bid $71.16
Kingston 6000| No Bid $54.86 $51.25 No Bid No Bid $55.09 $72.89 $130.00 |No Bid $70.25
Lakeville 2500 No Bid $54.78 $52.00 No Bid No Bid $52.76 $72.09 $130.00 |No Bid $70.88
Marion 350 No Bid $55.77 $54.27 No Bid No Bid $55.08 $73.32 $130.00 |No Bid $71.98
Marshfield 3400 No Bid $56.41 $51.25 No Bid No Bid $56.19 $72.89 $131.00 |No Bid $70.06
Mashpee 3000 No Bid $58.12 $55.75 No Bid No Bid $57.71 $74.85 $131.00 |No Bid $63.90
Mattapoisett 600 No Bid $55.92 $54.40 No Bid No Bid $54.07 $72.09 $131.00 |No Bid $68.50
Middleborough 4000 No Bid $54.78 $51.95 No Bid No Bid $53.49 $70.93 $131.00 |No Bid $70.70
Nantucket 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $195.12 0 $158.00 |No Bid No Bid
Orleans 850 No Bid $61.85 $59.06 No Bid No Bid $69.78 $77.42 $135.00 |No Bid $73.75
Pembroke 6000 No Bid $54.86 $51.10 No Bid No Bid $55.52 $72.89 $131.00 |No Bid $70.15
Plymouth 10000 No Bid $54.86 $51.50 No Bid No Bid $55.03 $72.09 $130.00 |No Bid $70.79
Plympton 800 No Bid $54.78 $51.39 No Bid No Bid $53.79 $72.09 $130.00 |No Bid $71.16
Provincetown 1200 No Bid $64.96 $62.85 No Bid No Bid $73.26 $79.72 $140.00 |No Bid $76.59
Rochester 1500 No Bid $55.81 $53.53 No Bid No Bid $53.50 $73.32 $131.00 |No Bid $72.34
Rockland 2200 No Bid $54.86 $50.50 No Bid No Bid $55.19 $72.76 $130.00 |No Bid $69.43
Sandwich 5000 No Bid $57.37 $54.25 No Bid No Bid $54.99 $74.85 $130.00 |No Bid $71.33
Truro 125 No Bid $63.93 $61.68 No Bid No Bid $72.10 $79.09 $131.00 |No Bid $75.62
Wellfleet 600 No Bid $63.36 $60.96 No Bid No Bid $71.90 $79.09 $135.00 |No Bid $75.13
Whitman 2500 No Bid $54.78 $50.50 No Bid No Bid $55.33 $72.56 $131.00 |No Bid $69.97
Yarmouth 1200 No Bid $59.46 $57.00 No Bid No Bid $57.42 $77.11 $131.00 |No Bid $72.62
* Morton Salt has rescinded their original price of $78.25 for Nantucket.




Town of Plymouth - Regional Salt Bid Results

Bid # 21621 October 6, 2016

Pre-Mix Treated Salt

G.B. Sons Safe
All State | American Eastern | Constructio |1hnovative [Mid- P.A. Road Saltine
Est. Asphalt, Rock Salt Minerals | n Company, |Surface American [*Morton |Landers, Services, |Warrior,

Town S Amt. Inc. Co., LLC Inc. Inc. Solutions Salt, LLC |Salt, Inc. |Inc. LLC Inc.
Barnstable 4000 No Bid No Bid $81.00 No Bid No Bid $74.45 $99.11 $157.00 No Bid No Bid
Carver 500 No Bid No Bid $77.30 No Bid No Bid $74.13 $94.09 $157.00 No Bid No Bid
Halifax 2750 No Bid No Bid $71.20 No Bid No Bid $73.23 $94.09 $157.00 No Bid No Bid
Nantucket 500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $219.55 $100.25 $183.00 No Bid No Bid
Orleans 300 No Bid No Bid $84.00 No Bid No Bid $89.54 $107.42 $165.00 No Bid No Bid

*Morton Salt, Inc. added pricing for Plymouth at $94.09/ton.

=)




Town of Plymouth

Regional Salt Bid Results

Bid # 21621

October 6, 2016

Liquid Calcium Chloride

G.B. Sons Safe

*All State American E?stern Constructio 1,nhovative P.A. Road Saltine

Asphalt, Rock Salt Minerals n Company, surface Mid-American Morton Salt, Landers, Services, Warrior,
Town Inc. Co., LLC Inc. Inc. Solutions Salt, LLC Inc. Inc. LLC Inc.
Per truck load (001-2,000 gallons) $1.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per truck load (2,001-4,000 gallons) $1.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per truck load (4,001-5,000 gallons) $1.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per truck load (5,001+ gallons) $1.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

*All States Asphalt, Inc. - Prices quoted do not include Edgartown and Provincetown




Town of Plymouth

Regional Salt Bid Results

Bid # 21621 October 6, 2016
Magnesium Chloride
G.B. Sons

All State American Eastern  Constructio phhovative Mid- P.A. Safe Road Saltine

Asphalt, Rock Salt Minerals n Company, surface American Morton Salt, Landers, Services, Warrior,
Town Inc. Co., LLC Inc. Inc. Solutions Salt, LLC Inc. Inc. LLC Inc.
Per truck load (001-2,000 gallons) No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.22 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per truck load (2,001-4,000 gallons) No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.22 $0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per truck load (4,001-5,000 gallons) No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.22 $0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Per truck load (5,001+ gallons) No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.22 $0.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




Town of Plymouth

Regional Salt Bid Results

Bid # 21621

October 6, 2016

Agricultural By-Product
|

Q.b. D0Nns

***Safe

*All  American Eastern Construction 1,,ovative Mid- *kp A, Road Saltine

State Rock Salt Minerals Company, surface American Morton Landers, Services, Warrior,
Town Asphalt Co., LLC Inc. Inc. Solutions  Salt, LLC Salt, Inc. Inc. LLC Inc.
Per truck load (001-2,000 gallons) $1.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 $1.30 No Bid
Per truck load (2,001-4,000 gallons) $1.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.50 $1.30 No Bid
Per truck load (4,001-5,000 gallons) $1.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.32 No Bid No Bid $2.25 $1.25 No Bid
Per truck load (5,001+ gallons) $1.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.32 No Bid No Bid $2.25 $1.25 No Bid

*All States Asphalt, Inc. - Prices quoted do not include Edgartown and Provincetown

** pP_A. Landers, Inc. - the price per truck load for (001-2,000 gallons) is $2.25/gallon

PLUS a $300 delivery ch

arge

***Safe Road Services - add ferry charge for Edgartown and Nantucket




