Town of Plymouth

Regional Road Sand Bid Results

Bid 21622
10/6/2016
Company and Bid (dollars & cents per ton)
Cape Sand G. Lopes P.A.
and Recycling,| Construction Landers,
Town Quantity LLC Inc. M+M Sand Inc.

Abington 300 No Bid $13.84 No Bid $17.42
Barnstable 1000 No Bid $13.84 No Bid $17.42
Brewster 2000 $8.75 $16.90 $9.99 $17.42
Carver 500 No Bid $9.80 No Bid $15.73
Chatham 600 $10.00 $16.80 $12.25 $19.06
Cohasset 1500 No Bid $13.90 No Bid $15.73
Eastham 200 $10.00 $17.50 $14.25 $19.06
Halifax 500 No Bid $12.23 No Bid $15.73
Hull 2000 No Bid $15.44 No Bid $17.42
Kingston 100 No Bid $10.90 No Bid $15.73
Lakeville 2500 No Bid $11.15 No Bid $17.42
Marion 2000 No Bid $11.15 No Bid $17.42
Marshfield 700 No Bid $11.70 No Bid $14.95
Mashpee 2000 No Bid $13.90 No Bid $15.75
Mattapoisett 900 No Bid $12.23 No Bid $17.42
Orleans 400 $10.00 $17.50 $13.00 $19.06
Pembroke 7500 No Bid $11.69 No Bid $15.78
Plympton 1500 No Bid $12.98 No Bid $15.78
Sandwich 1500 No Bid $12.23 No Bid $12.00
Whitman 1500 No Bid $14.18 No Bid $17.42




