

May 4, 2017

Bid 21718 Drainage Materials

Materials	Unit	Acme-Shorey	
		Delivered	Pick Up
.			
9a. Bituminous Concrete Type I-1 (Picked Up)	TON	NO BID	NO BID
9b. Bituminous Concrete Type I-1 Baby Binder(Picked Up)	TON	NO BID	NO BID
9c. Cold Patch - All Purpose (Picked Up)	TON	NO BID	NO BID
.			
13a. Concrete Blocks - Catch Basin Unit	EA	NO BID	NO BID
13b. Concrete Blocks - 6x6 Barrel Unit	EA	NO BID	NO BID
13c. Concrete Blocks - Arch Unit	EA	NO BID	NO BID
13d. Concrete Blocks - Ring Row Set	EA	NO BID	NO BID
13e. Concrete Blocks - #4 Plates Set	EA	NO BID	NO BID
13f. Pre-Cast Concrete 4' Sump	EA	\$ 240.00	NO BID
.			
14a. Drywell - Concrete Blocks	EA	NO BID	NO BID
14b. Drywell - Concrete Cover	EA	\$ 75.00	NO BID
.			
17a. Leaching Sleeve H20 - 6' Dia x 3' Deep	EA	\$ 285.00	NO BID
17b. Leaching Sleeve H20 - 6' Dia x 4' Deep	EA	\$ 372.00	NO BID
17c. Leaching Basin H20 - 6' Top	EA	\$ 365.00	NO BID
17d. Leaching Basin H20 - 8' Dia x 3' Deep	EA	\$ 545.00	NO BID
17e. Leaching Basin H20 - 8' Dia x 4' Deep	EA	\$ 710.00	NO BID
17f. Leaching Basin H20 - 8' Top	EA	\$ 665.00	NO BID
17g. Leaching Galley - 4' x 4' End or Middle	EA	\$ 280.00	NO BID
.			
18. Pre-Cast Catch Basin H20 with Flat Top & 4' Sump	EA	\$ 465.00	NO BID
.			
19a. Drain Manholes H20 - 4' Diameter Floor	EA	\$ 75.00	NO BID
19b. Drain Manholes H20 - 4' Diameter Flat Top	EA	\$ 110.00	NO BID
19c. Drain Manholes H20 - 4' Diameter Sidewall	EA	\$60.00/ft.	NO BID
19d. Drain Manholes H20 - 5' Diameter Floor	EA	\$ 155.00	NO BID
19e. Drain Manholes H20 - 5' Diameter Flat Top	EA	\$ 180.00	NO BID
19f. Drain Manholes H20 - 5' Diameter Sidewall	EA	\$95.00/ft.	NO BID
19g. Drain Manhole Steps	EA	\$ 8.00	NO BID
19h. Drain Manholes Conseal	EA	\$12.00/roll	NO BID
.			
20a. Reinforced Concrete Pipe Inlet Flared End - 12"	EA	NO BID	NO BID
20b. Reinforced Concrete Pipe Inlet Flared End - 15"	EA	NO BID	NO BID
20c. Reinforced Concrete Pipe Inlet Flared End - 18"	EA	NO BID	NO BID